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* * * P U B L I C     N O T I C E * * * 

 
The Civil Service Commission of the City of Bridgeport will conduct a competitive promotional examination for Fire Apparatus 
Foreman.  The exact date, time and location of the examination has been communicated to all qualified candidates. 
 
The information provided herein is for informational purposes only and is intended as a general summary only.  It is not, nor is to be 
intended to be, a Public Notice for this examination.  You should not rely on this communication as a complete or binding 
explanation of all examination details.  This summary is being provided in good faith and subject to the reasonable discretion of the 
Civil Service Commission office.  This summary does not constitute a contract of any kind, express or implied, between any applicant 
and the City of Bridgeport.  This informational guide is subject to correction of any information which may have been inadvertently 
misstated. 
 
SALARY RANGE:  $107,672 - $112,803 - $117,944; appointments to be made at the minimum or entrance salary of $107,672 per 
year.  Advancements within the salary range may be made in accordance with the terms of the contract between the City of 
Bridgeport and Bridgeport Fire Fighters Local 834, AFL-CIO. 
 
APPLICATIONS:  No new applications are being accepted at this time.  
 
DUTIES:  Supervisory and skilled work of more than ordinary difficulty and responsibility, with direct responsibility for supervising the 
maintenance, repair and installation of fire hydrant and related equipment; related work as required; performed under technical 
direction. 
 
REQUIREMENTS:  This examination is open to members of the Bridgeport Fire Department who have occupied, with tenure, the 
position of Fire Equipment Mechanic for not less than three (3) years immediately preceding July 1, 2024, and who meet the following 
requirements:  extensive knowledge and mastery of skills of hydrant planning, inspection, maintenance and repair; extensive 
knowledge of department rules, regulations and orders; through knowledge of hydraulics as they apply to firefighting requirements; 
mechanical ability; supervisory ability; ability to keeps records and reports; ability to prepare specifications covering requirements for 
fire hydrants and related equipment; resourcefulness; industry; good judgment; good health and freedom from disabling physical 
defects.  
 
SUBJECTS OF EXAMINATION:  Oral examination and performance test on the knowledge, skills and abilities involved in performing 
the duties, relative weight, 7; seniority, relative weight, 1; training, experience and general qualifications, relative weight 2.  Candidate 
will be required to attain at least 75% in each announced subject of examination.  Candidate will be required to pass a qualifying 
service rating in order to be placed on the employment list. 
 
SPECIAL ACCOMMODATION: The Civil Service Commission will provide reasonable accommodation for persons with a disability to 
take a test. To request special accommodation, please submit, in writing, a statement of what type of accommodation is being 
requested.  You will be required to provide proof of any disability requiring accommodation.  This request must be received by the 
Office of the Civil Service Commission at least 14 days prior to the examination date.  
 
EXAMINATION REVIEW PROCEDURES:  Each candidate will have an opportunity to review his or her examination during the one-
month period after the date of announced results.  The papers will be open to inspection during the hours of 9:00 A.M. to 1:00 P.M. 
Monday through Friday, excluding holidays.  Every inspection period will be monitored by the staff of the Civil Service Office, and no 
candidate will be allowed to copy examination questions or to take any written material from the review room.   
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